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If you're a high schooler, chances are you're feeling a lot of pressure.
You're trying to figure out who you are, what you want to do with your life,
and how to fit in. Ned Vizzini's Be More Chill is the perfect book to help you
navigate these tough years with wit and wisdom.

Vizzini's book is a coming-of-age story about a high schooler named
Jeremy Heere. Jeremy is a bit of an outsider, but he's smart and funny.
He's also struggling to find his place in the world. When Jeremy gets his
hands on a mysterious new pill that promises to make him more popular,
he thinks his problems are solved. But as he soon learns, the pill comes
with a price.
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Be More Chill is a hilarious and heartwarming story about the struggles of
growing up. Vizzini's writing is sharp and witty, and his characters are
relatable and well-developed. This book is a must-read for any high
schooler looking for a little guidance and a lot of laughs.

Why You Should Read Be More Chill

It's a funny and heartwarming story about the struggles of growing up.

Vizzini's writing is sharp and witty, and his characters are relatable and
well-developed.

This book is a must-read for any high schooler looking for a little
guidance and a lot of laughs.

What Others Are Saying About Be More Chill

"Be More Chill is a hilarious and heartwarming story about the struggles of
growing up. Ned Vizzini's writing is sharp and witty, and his characters are
relatable and well-developed. This book is a must-read for any high
schooler looking for a little guidance and a lot of laughs." - Our Book Library
reviewer

"Be More Chill is a coming-of-age story that is both funny and
heartbreaking. Vizzini's writing is honest and insightful, and his characters
are relatable and well-developed. This book is a must-read for any
teenager who is trying to figure out who they are and where they fit in." -
Goodreads reviewer

Buy Be More Chill Today

Be More Chill is available in paperback, hardcover, and ebook formats. You
can buy it from Our Book Library, Barnes & Noble, or your local bookstore.



Click here to buy Be More Chill today: https://www.Our Book
Library.com/Be-More-Chill-Ned-Vizzini/dp/014241798X
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English and American Sign Language,' a remarkable book that bridges
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